

<b>COUNTY: DeKalb</b>	<b>DATE: May 1, 2014</b>									
<b>TOWNSHIP:</b>			<b>NAME AND ADDRESS</b>							
<b>SECTION:</b>	<b>New Tandem Truck Cab &amp; Chassis</b>		<b>OF</b>							
<b>ESTIMATE:</b>			<b>BIDDERS</b>							
<b>PROPOSAL GUARANTEE:</b>					CIT Group, Inc.	JX Peterbilt	TransChicago			
					4301 N. Bell School Road	4260 Linden Road	776 N York Street			
<b>TERMS:</b>					Loves Park, IL 61111	Rockford, IL 61109	Elmhurst, IL 60126			
<b>ITEM NO. OR GROUP</b>	<b>ITEMS</b>	<b>DELIVERY</b>	<b>UNIT</b>	<b>QUANTITY</b>	<b>UNIT PRICE</b>	<b>UNIT PRICE</b>	<b>UNIT PRICE</b>	<b>UNIT PRICE</b>	<b>UNIT PRICE</b>	<b>TOTAL</b>
					(Kenworth)	(Mack)	(Model 348)	(Model 365)		
1	New Tandem Truck Cab and Chassis	FOB	Each	1	\$ 111,814.80	\$ 99,941.92	\$ 92,750.00	\$ 108,080.00	\$ 93,530.00	
	Trade Allowance 2002 Sterling LT8513		Each	1	\$ 16,932.10	\$ 16,932.10	\$ 21,000.00	\$ 21,000.00	\$ 16,350.00	
	<b>Net Cost:</b>				\$ 94,882.70	\$ 83,009.82	\$ 71,750.00	\$ 87,080.00		\$ 77,180.00
	<b>OPTIONS IF AVAILABLE:</b>									
2	Heated Windshield, with 185 Amp. Alterna.	FOB	Each	1	\$ 177.00	Not Available	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 557.00	
3	Suspended Brake and Accelerator Pedals	FOB	Each	1	Not Available	No Charge	No Bid	No Bid	No Charge	
4	Engine Warranty: 60 months or 100,000 miles	FOB	Each	1	\$ 2,750.00	\$ 3,150.00	Included	Included	\$ 2,050.00	
5	Transmission Warranty: Minimum 5 years unlimited mile extended warranty	FOB	Each	1	\$ 285.00	\$ 285.00	\$ 446.00	\$ 446.00	\$ 546.00	
	<b>Grand Total:</b>				Kenworth	<b>\$ 98,094.70</b>	Model 348	<b>\$ 72,196.00</b>		<b>\$ 80,333.00</b>
					Mack	<b>\$ 86,444.82</b>	Model 365	<b>\$ 87,526.00</b>		